City of Phenix City
Bid Tabulation

Bid: U18-01 Chemical
Opening Date: April 12,2018 @ 10:00 am

Vendor: Allled Universal Corp. |Vendor: C & S Chemicals Vendor: Cedarchem Vendor: Chemtrade
BidBond X __ Check Bid Bond _ X __ Check Bid Bond _X__ Check Bid Bond _X__ Check
Quantty
Item No. Item Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Liquid Chlorine {WWTP & WFP) tons 80 $455.44 NO BID
2 Sulfur Dioxide {WWTP) tons 10 S684.44 NQ BID
$1.73/18
3 Dry Polymer {(WWTP) {lbs 9,000 NQ BID YEARLY TOTAL 515,570.00
$1.09/L8
4 Liquid Polymer {WWTP) Ibs 82,440 NO BID YEARLY TOTAL 589,859.60
S0.1025/0aYLe $0.1165/DRY LB
P205/DRYTON $233/DRY TON
5 Aluminum Sulfate (WFP) Ibs 325,000 NQ BID $0.05/WET LB NQ BID
6 Granular Soda Ash {WFP} Ibs 550,000 NO BID NO 610
7 Hydrofloustlicic Acid {WFP) Ibs 100,000 NQ BID NO BID
8 Pgtassium Permanganate {WFP) Ibs 3,500 NO BID NO BID
Vendor: Geo Specialty Chem  |Vendor: Shannon Chemical Vendor: SNF, Inc. Vendor: DPC Enterprises
Bid Bond _ X__ Check Bid Bond Check X Bid Bond X -Check Bid Bond __X  Check
Quanity
Item No. tem Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
$758/TON, $50 MONHTLY
1 _n-lnkﬁ Chlorine (WWTP & WFP) tons S0 NO BID RENTAL PER CONTAINER
S830/TON, 550 MONTHLY
2 Sulfur Dioxide [WWTP] tons 10 NO BID RENTAL PER CONTAINER
3 Dry Polymer [WWTP) Ibs 8,000 NQ BID
4 Liquid Polymer [WWTP} 1bs 82,440 NQ BID
$0.1285/ DRY LB
5 Aluminum Sulfate (WFP} Ibs 325,000 5257/TON NO BID
6 Granular Soda Ash {WFP} Ibs 990,000 NO BID
7 Hydroflousilicic Acid {WFP) Ibs 100,000 NG BID
8 Potassium Permanganate (WFP) Ibs 3,500 $1.74/LB NG BID
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City of Phenix City
Bid Tabulation

Bid: U18-01 Chemical
Opening Date: April 12,2018 @ 10:00 am

Vendor; THORNTON, MUSSD, &
Vendor: HARCROS BELLAMY Vendor: SOLENIS Vendor: UNIVAR
Bid Bond __X__ Check Bid Bond Check__X__ |BidBond _X__ Check BidBond _ X Check
Quanity
Item No. Item Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Liquid Chlorine {WWTP B WFP) tons S0 NOQ BID
2 Sulfur Dioxide {(WWTP) tons 10 NO BID
PRAESTOL 644BC - $1 61/18
3 |Dry Polymer (WwTP) Ibs 9,000 $2.05/L85 W S S NO BID
$2.45/ ACTIVE LB
$203,626.80 TOTAL PER YEAR
4 Liquid Polymer (WWTP) lbs 82,440/ $2.00/1.BS {46% ACTIVE} NO BID
5 Aluminum Sulfate (WFP}) Ibs 325,000 NO BID
$0.18/LB, MIN 24 TONS
6 Granular Soda Ash (WFP} Ibs 990,000 $0.186/LB LOADS
7 Hydroflousilicic Acld {WFP) Ibs 100,000 $0.7783/L8 50.73/DRY LB {23% BASIS)
$2.25/LB, MIN 36 PAILS
8 Potassium Permanganate {WFP) lbs 3,500 51.85/i8 PER DELIVERY
Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor:
Bid Bond Check Bid Bond Check Bid Bond Check Bid Bond Check
Quanity
Item No. Item Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Liquid Chlorine (WWTP & WFP) tons 90/
2 Sulfur Dioxide (WWTP) tons 10
3 Dry Polymer (WWTP) ibs 9,000
4 Ligquld Polymer [WWTP) lbs 82,440
5 Aluminum Sulfate {WFP) Ibs 325,000
] Granular Scda Ash (WFP) Ibs 990,000
7 Hydroflousllicic Acid (WFP) Ibs 100,000
8 Potassium Permanganate {WFP) Ibs 3,500
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