
Item No. Item

Cost/Ton FOB 

Supply Point  

Address: 

______________

______________

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City

601 12th St

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City  

Various Sites

Cost/Ton FOB 

Supply Point  

Address: 

______________

______________

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City

601 12th St

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City  

Various Sites

Cost/Ton FOB 

Supply Point  

Address: 

______________

______________

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City

601 12th St

Cost/Ton

FOB City of 

Phenix City  

Various Sites

1 ALDOT #1 Stone NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 ALDOT #4 Stone 22.75 29.75 30.75

3 ALDOT #467 Stone  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

4 ALDOT #5 Stone 22.34 29.35 30.35

5 ALDOT #6 Stone 22.55 29.55 30.55

6 ALDOT #57 Stone 23.15 30.15 31.15

7 ALDOT #78 Stone 26.25 33.25 34.25

8 ALDOT #89 Stone 26.25 33.25 34.25

9 ALDOT #810 Stone 18.35 25.35 26.35

10 ALDOT Class 1 Rip Rap 25.00 32.00 33.00

11 ALDOT Class 2 Rip Rap 26.00 34.00 35.00

12 ALDOT Class 3 Rip Rap 27.00 36.00 37.00

13 ALDOT Crushed Aggregate Base 17.00 24.00 25.00

14 Surge Stone 23.00 30.00 31.00

15 Soil Aggregate Base 14.00 21.00 22.00

16 Coarse Sand 16.35 23.35 24.35

17 ALDOT #825 TYPE A NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 ALDOT #825 TYPE B 17.00 24.00 25.00

CITY OF PHENIX CITY
BID TABULATION: E23-02 AGGREGATES

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 5 @ 10:00 AM EST

Vendor:   

 Bid Bond ____    Check _____

Vendor:   COLUMBUS QUARRY

 Bid Bond ____    Check _____

Vendor:   

 Bid Bond ____    Check _____




